


I N D U L G E N C E

We send our guests on a holistic pleasure journey that truly  

indulges all the senses. Seeing, hearing, tasting, smelling and feeling -  

all our aspects of pleasure are united by a deep connection with nature.  

It serves as a source of tranquility and a place of strength, inviting you  

to take a deep breath and sharpening your senses anew. Carefully  

selected natural products are used in our Acquapura SPAS to create  

comfort and sustainably enhance the well-being of our guests.  

Embedded in an inspiring environment of high-quality design,  

accompanied by culinary slow food delights, we open up space and  

time to recharge your batteries and find your own center. 

„No pleasure is temporary;  
for the impression it leaves behind is lasting.“  

Johann Wolfgang von Goethe
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We have made it our goal to offer our guests tailor-made  

vacation experiences in every phase of life and for all needs.  

The highest quality standards with an individual touch and the  

cozy Welcome Home feeling meet with a wide range of design  

options for a vacation with an innovative program offering that  

leaves nothing to be desired. A time out made for providing our  

guests with unforgettable memories!



 
I N D U L G E N C E

Specials

R O C K  T R A I L 
S P O R T S  M A S S A G E 
Full body massage | Celtic 
stamp & stone combs | Releases 
tension | Rehabilitation |  
Arnica massage oil

¤ 75  5 0   M I N

E N E R G Y  O F  
T H E  W O O D S

Invigorating foot massage | 
Relaxing head & face  
massage | Forest aroma oil 

¤ 75  5 0   M I N

R E L A X  E M O T I O N 
Warm oiling | Herbal stamp 
massage | Stress reduction | 
Prevention | Fragrances  
according to the 4 elements  
to choose from

¤ 90  6 0   M I N

¤ 115  8 0   M I N

M O O R  F O R E S T

Warm, packed mud |  
Individual back massage |  
Pain-relieving | Anti- 
inflammatory | Promotes  
circulation 

¤ 75  5 0   M I N

Leg massage can be added + € 15



T R E A T M E N T S

Signature

S I N G A P O R E  
M A S S A G E

Foot peeling and washing | 
Back massage, abdominal  
massage & foot reflex  
stimulation according to  
Asian techniques | Fatigue 
reduction

¤ 90  6 0   M I N

C O C O O N  P A C K

Choice of hay pack or  
cream pack | Relaxation

¤ 45  3 0   M I N

A L K A L I N E  
P E E L I N G

Full body peeling | Alkaline  
salt from Upper Austria |  
Flushes out acids | Increases 
well-being | Velvety skin  
feeling

¤ 45  3 0   M I N

Cocoon pack can be booked  
additionally + 20 min. € 25
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