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PARADOX HOTEL VANCOUVER NAMED AS ONE OF HOTELS.COM  

‘PERFECT SOMEWHERES’ 2024 
 

 
 
 
VANCOUVER, June 21st, 2024 – Paradox Hotel Vancouver is thrilled to announce its recognition by 
Hotels.com as one of the ‘Perfect Somewheres’ 2024 during the EXPLORE 24 event, Expedia’s annual 
partner conference in Las Vegas on May 15th, 2024. This prestigious accolade celebrates the top 1% of 
hotels globally, distinguished through Hotels.com’s scientific evaluation of guest reviews, in-stay 
feedback, and social media posts. The award underscores Paradox Hotel Vancouver's dedication to 
providing exceptional and memorable experiences for travelers.  
 
On behalf of the entire Paradox Vancouver team, we extend a heartfelt thank you to our valued guests 
and our amazing team members. You are the true heroes behind our victory. 
 
Mr. Tony Medd, General Manager of Paradox Hotel Vancouver, celebrated this achievement by unveiling 
an exclusive behind-the-scenes video showcasing the hotel’s guest services staff while attending the 
Explore24 event. The video emphasizes the unique qualities and dedicated service that distinguish 
Paradox Hotel Vancouver as an exceptional destination.  

 

 
Photo credit: Expedia Group 
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Furthermore, during the event, Mr. Andrew Cu, the hotel's chef concierge, was recognized as one of the 
hospitality heroes. Known for his heartwarming gestures, Andrew famously chartered a seaplane to return 
a forgotten wallet to its owner, exemplifying the extraordinary lengths the Paradox team goes to ensure 
guest satisfaction. 
 

 
Photo credit: Expedia Group 

 
Link to watch full video: Video 
 
“Being named one of Hotels.com’s ‘Perfect Somewheres’ is a testament to the hard work and dedication 
of our entire team,” said Tony Medd. “Our goal is to create unparalleled experiences for our guests, and 
this recognition affirms that we are succeeding.” 
 
The 'Perfect Somewheres 2024' award program is unique in its comprehensive approach to evaluating 
hospitality excellence, ensuring that guests at Paradox Hotel Vancouver can book with confidence, 
knowing they are choosing a hotel committed to top-tier service and unforgettable experiences. 
 
For more information on the selection process for “Perfect Somewheres” 2024, please visit Hotels.com. 
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## 
 
**About Paradox Hotel Vancouver** 
 
Nestled in the heart of Vancouver's vibrant West End, Paradox Hotel Vancouver redefines luxury with 
relational hospitality. The award-winning luxury lifestyle hotel is your gateway to the city's iconic 
attractions such as Coal Harbour, Gastown, Stanley Park, and a treasure trove of high-end fashion retail 
outlets and dining in downtown Vancouver. The accommodations at Paradox Hotel Vancouver blend 
urban residential living and sophistication across its 147 stylish guest rooms, 16 bespoke one-bedroom 
suites, and the crown jewel Paradox One-Bedroom Suite, all encased in Arthur Erickson's renowned 
twisting tower. Along with 15,000 sq. ft. of innovative event spaces, a serene 6,000 sq. ft. spa, fitness 
centre, indoor pool, and a sprawling 3,982 sq. ft. terrace, we deliver experiences tailored to impress. Our 
partnerships with Mott 32, Karma Lounge, and Mansion Nightclub fuel the city's gastronomical and 
nightlife scene. For more information, please visit www.paradoxhotels.com/vancouver. 
 
**About Paradox Hotels & Resorts** 
 
Paradox Hotels & Resorts is an innovative hospitality brand and award-winning hotel collective that 
develops, operates, and markets exceptional boutique lifestyle hotels & resorts across the world. All 
Paradox hotels proudly showcase Canadian hospitality manifested through thoughtful design, best-in-
class facilities and guest services, and bespoke dining and gathering concepts. For more information, 
please visit www.paradoxhotels.com. 
 
**About Expedia Group** 
 
Expedia Group Inc. brands power travel for everyone, everywhere through our global platform. Driven by 
the core belief that travel is a force for good, we help people experience the world in new ways and build 
lasting connections. We provide industry-leading technology solutions to fuel partner growth and success 
while facilitating memorable experiences for travelers. Our organization is made up of three pillars: 
Expedia Product & Technology, Expedia Brands, and Expedia for Business. For more information, visit 
www.expediagroup.com. 
 
**About Hotels.com®** 
 
Hotels.com makes it easy to find your perfect somewhere with hundreds of thousands of places to stay 
around the world. So whether you're looking for value in Vegas, treehouses in Thailand, or villas with 
views, it's all just a click away. Booking just got smarter too. With over 25 million real guest reviews and 
an app so easy to use that it's been downloaded 70 million times, you can be sure to find the perfect place 
for you. For more information, visit www.hotels.com. 
 
**Media Contact** 
 
media@paradoxhotels.com 
 

http://www.paradoxhotels.com/vancouver
mailto:media@paradoxhotels.com
http://www.apple.com/

